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Headings
God responds to Solomon's
prayer.

Solomon offers a lengthy
prayer to God.

Solomon presides over the
dedication of the temple.

Short Summaries
Solomon prays for wisdom
and God grants his request.
He then builds the temple
and dedicates it to God.

1 Kings 8 is the story of
King Solomon's prayer of
dedication for the newly
built temple in Jerusalem. In
his prayer, Solomon
acknowledges God's
faithfulness to His promises
and asks for His continued
blessings on the people of
Israel.

Summaries
In 1 Kings 8, King Solomon
built a temple for the Lord,
and then he and the people
of Israel sacrificed to the
Lord. After the sacrifice,
Solomon prayed for God's
blessing on the people of
Israel.

In 1 Kings 8, King Solomon
brings the Ark of the
Covenant into the temple
he has built for the Lord. He
prays for God's forgiveness
and wisdom, and God
blesses him.

Application Questions
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What does it mean to put
God first in my life?

What is the importance of
repentance?

What kind of things should
I pray for?

How can I find comfort and
strength in God?

What is Dedication and
how important is it?

How can I make my
relationship with God
stronger?

How can I know that I am
always forgiven?

What does it mean to have
a relationship with God?

Exegetical Questions
What is the significance of
the ark being brought into
the temple?

What is the meaning of the
phrase "the glory of the
Lord filled the temple"?

What is the meaning of the
phrase "the Lord will dwell
among the people of Israel
forever"?

What is the meaning of the
phrase "the Lord signed a
covenant with the house of
Israel"?

What is the significance of
the temple being built
according to Solomon's
specifications?

What is the significance of
Solomon's prayer of
dedication?

Why was the temple built
on Mount Zion?

What is the meaning of the
phrase "the Lord has
established his throne in
the heavens"?

Observation Questions
Why was the Ark brought
into the temple?

How long did the
dedication ceremony last?

How many oxen were
slaughtered as part of the
dedication ceremony?

How many steps led up to
the main entrance of the
temple?

What was on top of the
Ark?

What did the people do
when they heard Solomon's
prayer?

What kind of wood was
used to build the inside of
the temple?

What were the dimensions
of the temple?
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Group Discussion Questions
Why do you think it was
important to Solomon that
the temple be built "so that
the name of the Lord
[would] be there forever"?
(v. 13)

What do you think is the
significance of God's
promise to "answer"
Solomon's prayer "from
heaven"? (v. 24)

What does it mean that
God "has chosen to put his
Name there for eternity" in
v. 20?

What do you think is the
significance of the fact that
"fire came down from
heaven and consumed the
burnt offering and the
sacrifices"? (v.
9)

What do you think is the
significance of Solomon's
prayer that God would
"resolve the dilemma" of
anyone who "has no
helper"? (v. 26)

What do you think is the
significance of the fact that,
according to v. 29, "the
whole assembly of
Israel...stood...before the
Lord"?

What does it mean that the
ark was brought "into the
inner sanctuary of the
temple, to the Most Holy
Place"? (v. 6)

What do you think is the
significance of the fact that
the "cloud" filled the
"temple of the Lord"? (v. 10)

Prayers Based on 1 Kings 8
Dear God, we praise you
and we thank you for all
that you have done for us.

Dear God, we are so
grateful for your love and
your care.

Dear God, thank you for
giving us a place to worship
you.

Dear God, thank you for
bringing the ark to the
temple.

Dear God, thank you for
your goodness and your
mercy.

Journal Prompts
What would I pray for if I
were given the opportunity
to speak to God directly?

What would I say if I were
given the opportunity to
say one last thing to a

What would it be like to
have the Ark of the
Covenant in my
possession?
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loved one who had passed
away?

What would I do if I were
confronted with a life-or-
death situation?

How would I feel if I were
present at the dedication of
the Temple?

What would I do if I
discovered that I had a
terminal illness?

What would I do if I won
the lottery?

How would I react if I found
out that someone close to
me had been unfaithful?

About This Page
This page features content generated by an artifical intelligence (AI) related to 1 Kings 8 and
reviewed by humans. Some of it may be unhelpful, offensive, or heretical, so please use it with
caution, especially if you’re a new Christian. Feel free to vote up content you find helpful or
vote down content you find unhelpful.

« 1 Kings 7 | 1 Kings 9 »

Unless otherwise indicated, all content is licensed under a Creative Commons Attribution License. All Scripture
quotations, unless otherwise indicated, are taken from The Holy Bible, English Standard Version. Copyright
©2001 by Crossway Bibles, a publishing ministry of Good News Publishers. Contact me: openbibleinfo (at)
gmail.com.

12/5/24, 11:49 AM 1 Kings 8: AI-Assisted Bible Study

https://www.openbible.info/labs/ai-bible-study/passage/1Kgs.8 4/4

https://www.openbible.info/labs/ai-bible-study/passage/1Kgs.7
https://www.openbible.info/labs/ai-bible-study/passage/1Kgs.9
http://creativecommons.org/licenses/by/4.0/
http://www.crosswaybibles.org/

